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MEETINGS NOTICE
Notice is hereby given, pursuant to 
section 46 of the Local Government 
Official Information and Meetings Act 
1987, of the following meetings of the 
Northland Regional Council.  These 
meetings are open to the public and 
will be held at the Council Offices, 
36 Water Street, Whangārei, unless 
otherwise specified.  In the event, due 
to COVID-19 restrictions, a meeting 
must be held remotely then it will 
be made open to the public through 
online access (as per the Epidemic 
Preparedness (COVID19) Notice 
2020).

Regional Transport Committee
Tuesday 7 June 2022 at 11.00 am 

Kaipara Moana Remediation Joint 
Committee
Monday 13 June 2022 at 9.30 am (to 
be held remotely)

Civil Defence Emergency 
Management Group
Wednesday 14 June 2022 at 11.00 am

Investment and Property 
Subcommittee (Extraordinary 
meeting)
Wednesday 14 June 2022 at 1.00 
pm (please note that business will be 
conducted in public excluded)

Te Oneroa-a-Tōhē Board Meeting
Friday 17 June 2022 at 10.00 am (to 
be held remotely)

Council Meeting
Tuesday 28 June 2022 at 10.30 am

Audit and Risk Subcommittee
Wednesday 29 June 2022 at 10.00 am

Investment and Property 
Subcommittee
Wednesday 29 June 2022 at 1.00 pm


